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Catherine Hayward Canada 

Werfen (honoraria; scientific 
advisory board); Stago (honoraria; 
scientific advisory board); UpToDate 
(royalties) 

Cathy Harrison United Kingdom 

CSL (Conference sponsorship; 
consultancy fee); Novo Nordisk 
(consultancy fee); Pfizer 
(consultancy fee); Roche-Chugai 
(conference sponsorship; 
consultancy fee); Sobi (consultancy 
fee); Takeda (conference 
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support); Sobi (personal fee/non-
financial support); Novo Nordisk 
(personal fee/non-financial 
support); CSL Behring (personal 
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fee/non-financial support) 

Curtis Yee United States Nothing to disclose 

Cyrus Njuguna Githinjii Kenya Nothing to disclose 

Daan Breederveld Netherlands To be confirmed 

Darrel Stafford United States To be confirmed 

David Lillicrap Canada 

Biomarin (research support and 
advisory role); CSL (advisory role); 
Novo Nordisk (advisory role); Pfizer 
(advisory role); Sanofi (research 
support and advisory role) 

David Page Canada Nothing to disclose 
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Flora Peyvandi Italy 

Takeda/Spark (Participation in 
educational meetings or symposia); 
Sanofi (Participation in advisory 
boards); Sobi (Participation in 
advisory boards); CSL Behring 
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Grace Hernandez United States 
Sanofi Genzyme (speaker bureau); 
Takeda (speaker bureau) 
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Maya Bloomberg United States 
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Mohsena Olath-Carramtally Mauritius Nothing to disclose 

Nathan Connell United States 

Takeda (consulting; advisory 
boards); Genentech (advisory 
boards); Octapharma (honoraria and 
travel support); Sanofi (advisory 
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